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  LINE        
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LOCATION        PRODUCT   DELIVERY         QUANTITY     

 STATE OF ALASKA

  440-75          KWAJALEIN       Marine Gas Oil   PIPELINE        122,000GL  

                        NO BID

  165-75      ANCHORAGE       Marine Gas Oil  TANK TRUCK     200,000GL  OPIS         

              OFFER NUMBER 21 NAME SHORESIDE PETROLEUM  B&F  STATUS   1.245900

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0142

  170-75       ANCHORAGE       Marine Gas Oil       BARGE           200,000GL  OPIS         

                OFFER NUMBER 21 NAME SHORESIDE PETROLEUM  B&F  STATUS   1.545900

                Withdrew Offer

  203-75    ANCHORAGE       Marine Gas Oil        PIPELINE        83,600GL  OPIS         

                OFFER NUMBER 21 NAME SHORESIDE PETROLEUM  B&F  STATUS   1.225900

  235-75    CORDOVA         Marine Gas Oil            PIPELINE       77,000GL  OPIS         

                   NO BID

  237-75  CORDOVA         Marine Gas Oil          TANK  TRUCK       105,600GL  

                NO BID

  200-75  DUTCH HARBOR    Marine Gas Oil       PIPELINE           3,458,950GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 6 NAME DELTA WESTERN, INC.  B&F  STATUS   1.3227


    Evaluated Price:  $.96126

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0099

                OFFER NUMBER 25 NAME VALDEZ PETROLEUM TER B&F  STATUS   1.438500

                 Evaluated Price: $1.199769
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450-75       DUTCH HARBOR    Marine Gas Oil PIPELINE         500,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 6 NAME DELTA WESTERN, INC.  B&F  STATUS   1.3385

                 Evaluated Price:  $.97706

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0099

                OFFER NUMBER 25 NAME VALDEZ PETROLEUM TER B&F  STATUS   1.738500

                 Evaluated Price:  $1.499769

  210-75           HOMER         Marine Gas Oil   TANK TRUCK      149,600GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 18 NAME PETRO MARINE SERVICE B&F  STATUS   1.435900

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0098

   215-75           HOMER           Marine Gas Oil   PIPELINE             35,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 18 NAME PETRO MARINE SERVICE B&F  STATUS   1.435900

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0098

  220-75 
JUNEAU          Marine Gas Oil TANK TRUCK      358,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 6 NAME DELTA WESTERN, INC.  B&F  STATUS   1.3457

                 Evaluated Price:  $.98426

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0099

                OFFER NUMBER 18 NAME PETRO MARINE SERVICE B&F  STATUS   1.330900

                 Evaluated Price:  $1.092169

223-75 

JUNEAU          Marine Gas Oil                 PIPELINE           100,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 6 NAME DELTA WESTERN, INC.  B&F  STATUS   1.3457

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0099

225-75 

KETCHIKAN       Marine Gas Oil             PIPELINE              150,200GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 18 NAME PETRO MARINE SERVICE B&F  STATUS   1.345900

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0098
  226-75 
 KETCHIKAN       Marine Gas Oil            TANK TRUCK          112,200GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 18 NAME PETRO MARINE SERVICE B&F  STATUS   1.345900

                            AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0098
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  452-75                KODIAK          Marine Gas Oil PIPELINE      175,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 18 NAME PETRO MARINE SERVICE B&F  STATUS   1.345900

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0098

                OFFER NUMBER 25 NAME VALDEZ PETROLEUM TER B&F  STATUS   1.398500

  240-75            PETERSBURG      Marine Gas Oil    TANK TRUCK      48,400GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 18 NAME PETRO MARINE SERVICE B&F  STATUS   1.475900

 250-75             SEWARD          Marine Gas Oil         TANK TRUCK     127,600GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 21 NAME SHORESIDE PETROLEUM  B&F  STATUS   1.395900

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0142

  453-75            SEWARD          Marine Gas Oil       PIPELINE               209,600GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 21 NAME SHORESIDE PETROLEUM  B&F  STATUS   1.395900

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0142

  245-75               SITKA           Marine Gas Oil          TANK TRUCK         80,300GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 18 NAME PETRO MARINE SERVICE B&F  STATUS   1.475900

435-75             VALDEZ          Marine Gas Oil            PIPELINE                 143,600GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 25 NAME VALDEZ PETROLEUM TER B&F  STATUS   1.448500

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0116

  349-75        BODEG BAY       Marine Gas Oil     TANK TRUCK             15,400GL  

                      NO BID

  347-75     CRESCENT CITY   Marine Gas        TANK TRUCK                16,500GL  

                     NO BID
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 300-75               EUREKA          Marine Gas TANK TRUCK      192,400GL  

                             NO BID

  301-75               EUREKA          Marine Gas Oil BARGE     150,000GL  

                        OFFER NUMBER 24 NAME TRANS-TEC SERVICES I B&F  STATUS   0.000000

                        Withdrew Offer

  400-75            LA JOLLA        Marine Gas TANK TRUCK      270,000GL  

                    OFFER NUMBER 13 NAME THE JANKOVICH COMPAN B&F  STATUS   1.210000

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0100

                     OFFER NUMBER 32 NAME GENERAL PETROLEUM    B&F  STATUS   1.290000

  355-75        MARINA DEL REY  Marine Gas TANK TRUCK       15,400GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 32 NAME GENERAL PETROLEUM    B&F  STATUS   1.490000

  351-75        MONTEREY        Marine Gas   TANK TRUCK         16,500GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 32 NAME GENERAL PETROLEUM    B&F  STATUS   1.990000

  160-75        MORRO BAY       Marine Gas    TANK TRUCK        100,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 32 NAME GENERAL PETROLEUM    B&F  STATUS   1.520000

  357-75        NEWPORT BEACH   Marine Gas TANK TRUCK        9,570GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 32 NAME GENERAL PETROLEUM    B&F  STATUS   1.580000

  359-75          OXNARD          Marine Gas    TANK TRUCK            31,900GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 32 NAME GENERAL PETROLEUM    B&F  STATUS   1.490000
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515-75             OXNARD          Marine Gas Oil   PIPELINE             2,032,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 24 NAME TRANS-TEC SERVICES I B&F  STATUS   0.000000

                Withdrew Offer

                OFFER NUMBER 23 NAME TESORO MARINE SERVIC B&F  STATUS   1.172000

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0118

  812-96            OXNARD                 Fuel Oil,                 PIPELINE             650,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 24 NAME TRANS-TEC SERVICES I B&F  STATUS   0.000000

                Withdrew Offer

                OFFER NUMBER 23 NAME TESORO MARINE SERVIC B&F  STATUS   0.872300

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0118

  812-98         OXNARD          Fuel Oil,                     PIPELINE                      500,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 24 NAME TRANS-TEC SERVICES I B&F  STATUS   0.000000

                Withdrew Offer

                OFFER NUMBER 23 NAME TESORO MARINE SERVIC B&F  STATUS   0.900500

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0118

  818-75            SAN DIEGO       Marine Gas Oil            BARGE                       2,800,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 24 NAME TRANS-TEC SERVICES I B&F  STATUS   0.000000

                Withdrew Offer

                OFFER NUMBER 13 NAME THE JANKOVICH COMPAN B&F  STATUS   1.180000

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0100

                OFFER NUMBER 32 NAME GENERAL PETROLEUM    B&F  STATUS   1.410000

  818-96
 SAN DIEGO       Fuel Oil,             BARGE                      1,500,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 24 NAME TRANS-TEC SERVICES I B&F  STATUS   0.000000

                Withdrew Offer

                OFFER NUMBER 13 NAME THE JANKOVICH COMPA B&F  STATUS   0.721000

                               AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0100
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  410-75      SAN FRANCISCO   Marine Gas TANK TRUCK       73,480GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 32 NAME GENERAL PETROLEUM    B&F  STATUS   1.330000

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0108

  816-75    SAN FRANCISCO       Marine Gas Oil     BARGE   1,788,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 24 NAME TRANS-TEC SERVICES I B&F  STATUS   0.000000

                Withdrew Offer

                OFFER NUMBER 32 NAME GENERAL PETROLEUM    B&F  STATUS   1.610000

  816-96      SAN FRANCISCO        Fuel Oil,         BARGE       1,200,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 24 NAME TRANS-TEC SERVICES I B&F  STATUS   0.807095

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0091

  816-98        SAN FRANCISCO     Fuel Oil,          BARGE           500,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 24 NAME TRANS-TEC SERVICES I B&F  STATUS   0.819488

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0091

  302-75          SAN PEDRO       Marine Gas        TANK TRUCK      132,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 13 NAME THE JANKOVICH COMPAN B&F  STATUS   1.200000

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0100

                OFFER NUMBER 32 NAME GENERAL PETROLEUM    B&F  STATUS   1.250000

  820-75       SAN PEDRO       Marine Gas Oil       BARGE              800,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 24 NAME TRANS-TEC SERVICES I B&F  STATUS   0.000000

                Withdrew Offer

                OFFER NUMBER 13 NAME THE JANKOVICH COMPAN B&F  STATUS   1.230000

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0100

                OFFER NUMBER 32 NAME GENERAL PETROLEUM    B&F  STATUS   1.250000
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  353-75        SANTA BARBARA   Marine Gas TANK TRUCK       16,500GL  

                      NO BID

 STATE OF CONNECTICUT

  377-75           NEW LONDON      Marine Gas  TANK TRUCK       58,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 5 NAME D & G OIL EXPLORATIO B&F  STATUS   2.950000

 STATE OF GUAM

  345-75      Apra Harbor, AGAMarine Gas TANK TRUCK             100,000GL  

                     NO BID

 STATE OF HAWAII

  310-75               HILO            Marine Gas TANK TRUCK             127,380GL  

                            NO BID

  420-75              HONOLULU        Marine Gas TANK TRUCK      300,000GL  

                         OFFER NUMBER 31 NAME Garlow Petroleum     B&F  STATUS   1.285000

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0090

  375-75                 KAHULUI         Marine Gas TANK TRUCK         30,800GL  

                                NO BID

  365-75                   KAILUA          Marine Gas TANK TRUCK          4,620GL  

                                 NO BID

  360-75                  KAWAIHAE        Marine Gas TANK TRUCK        4,620GL  

                                    NO BID

OFFICIAL ABSTRACT FOR Final Price Revision OFFER STATUS

MASTER SOLICITATION   SP0600-01-R-0114
                                                                        METHOD          MULTI-YEAR               

  LINE              BUNKER,                                 OF SUPPLY     ESTIMATED                     

  ITEM NO       LOCATION        PRODUCT   DELIVERY
        QUANTITY     

  315-75               MAUI            Marine Gas TANK TRUCK       55,000GL  

               
 NO BID

  370-75
 MOLIKAI         Marine Gas TANK TRUCK       34,100GL  

                
NO BID

  358-75 
NAWILIWILI      Marine Gas TANK TRUCK       49,500GL  

               
 NO BID

  578-75 
PEARL HARBOR    Marine Gas Oil BARGE   1,250,000GL  

                
NO BID

 STATE OF IOWA

  217-75
 DUBUQUE         Marine Gas TANK TRUCK       70,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 15 NAME MOLO OIL CO          B&F  STATUS   1.313200

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0096

STATE OF MAINE
  295-75
 PORTLAND        Marine Gas TANK TRUCK      300,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 2 NAME CONTINENTAL FUELS, I B&F  STATUS   1.339600

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0104

  227-75 
ROCKLAND        Marine Gas TANK TRUCK      240,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 14 NAME KALLOCH FUEL SERVICE B&F  STATUS   1.423700

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0095
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228-75           SOUTH PORTLAND  Marine Gas TANK TRUCK      240,000GL  

                        NO BID

 STATE OF MARYLAND

  532-75 
ANNAPOLIS       Marine Gas TANK TRUCK           270,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 30 NAME NAUGHTON ENERGY      B&F  STATUS   1.103100

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0097

                OFFER NUMBER 19 NAME PHOENIX PETROLEUM CO B&F  STATUS   1.162200

                OFFER NUMBER 5 NAME D & G OIL EXPLORATIO B&F  STATUS   3.390000

  118-34 
BALTIMORE       Diesel Fuel #2      TANK  TRUCK                   100,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 2 NAME CONTINENTAL FUELS, I B&F  STATUS   0.000000

                OFFER NUMBER 30 NAME NAUGHTON ENERGY      B&F  STATUS   1.103100

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0097

                OFFER NUMBER 19 NAME PHOENIX PETROLEUM CO B&F  STATUS   1.199700

                OFFER NUMBER 5 NAME D & G OIL EXPLORATIO B&F  STATUS   3.390000

   255-34
 BALTIMORE       Diesel Fuel #2

TANK TRUCK    
  300,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 30 NAME NAUGHTON ENERGY      B&F  STATUS   1.100600

                           AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0097

                OFFER NUMBER 19 NAME PHOENIX PETROLEUM CO B&F  STATUS   1.119200

                OFFER NUMBER 4 NAME CARIBOU MARINE SERVI B&F  STATUS   1.156000

                OFFER NUMBER 2 NAME CONTINENTAL FUELS, I B&F  STATUS   1.186800

                OFFER NUMBER 5 NAME D & G OIL EXPLORATIO B&F  STATUS   3.390000
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836-75                  BALTIMORE       Marine Gas Oil BARGE   1,800,000GL  

                           OFFER NUMBER 24 NAME TRANS-TEC SERVICES I B&F  STATUS   0.000000

                             Withdrew Offer

                            OFFER NUMBER 19 NAME PHOENIX PETROLEUM CO B&F  STATUS   1.149200

                                   AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0109

                            OFFER NUMBER 11 NAME HARBOR PETROLEM INC. B&F  STATUS   1.238000

                            OFFER NUMBER 2 NAME CONTINENTAL FUELS, I B&F  STATUS   1.319900

                             OFFER NUMBER 5 NAME D & G OIL EXPLORATIO B&F  STATUS   3.390000

STATE OF MASSACHUSETTS

  835-75 
BOSTON          Marine Gas Oil
 BARGE    
 800,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 2 NAME CONTINENTAL FUELS, I B&F  STATUS   1.242300

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0104

                OFFER NUMBER 5 NAME D & G OIL EXPLORATIO B&F  STATUS   3.450000

 835-75 
BOSTON          Marine Gas
 TANK TRUCK      400,000GL  

               OFFER NUMBER 22 NAME SPRAGUE ENERGY       B&F  STATUS   1.158400

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0105

                OFFER NUMBER 2 NAME CONTINENTAL FUELS, I B&F  STATUS   1.175200

                OFFER NUMBER 5 NAME D & G OIL EXPLORATIO B&F  STATUS   3.450000

  230-75 
NEW BEDFORD     Marine Gas TANK TRUCK      600,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 22 NAME SPRAGUE ENERGY       B&F  STATUS   1.165800

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0105

                OFFER NUMBER 2 NAME CONTINENTAL FUELS, I B&F  STATUS   1.245200

                OFFER NUMBER 7 NAME DREW OIL CORP.       B&F  STATUS   1.245200

                OFFER NUMBER 20 NAME SANTORO OIL CO. INC  B&F  STATUS   1.490000

                OFFER NUMBER 5 NAME D & G OIL EXPLORATIO B&F  STATUS   3.450000
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  296-75 
WOODS HOLE      Marine Gas TANK TRUCK      200,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 2 NAME CONTINENTAL FUELS, I B&F  STATUS   1.434000

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0104

                OFFER NUMBER 20 NAME SANTORO OIL CO. INC  B&F  STATUS   1.690000

                OFFER NUMBER 5 NAME D & G OIL EXPLORATIO B&F  STATUS   3.450000

 STATE OF MICHIGAN

  202-75 
CHARLEVOIX      Marine Gas TANK TRUCK      160,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 26 NAME WARNER PETROLEUM COR B&F  STATUS   1.290700

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0093

                OFFER NUMBER 9 NAME HALRON               B&F  STATUS   1.504800

 292-75 
CHEBOYGAN       Marine Gas TANK TRUCK       40,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 9 NAME HALRON               B&F  STATUS   1.704800

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0117

                OFFER NUMBER 26 NAME WARNER PETROLEUM COR B&F  STATUS   2.417700

  204-75
 DETROIT         Marine Gas TANK TRUCK      160,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 26 NAME WARNER PETROLEUM COR B&F  STATUS   1.160900

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0093

  207-75 
PORT HURON      Marine Gas TANK TRUCK       89,200GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 26 NAME WARNER PETROLEUM COR B&F  STATUS   1.366200

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0093

                OFFER NUMBER 9 NAME HALRON               B&F  STATUS   1.465900
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  208-75  SAULT STE. MARIE Marine Gas Oil TANK TRUCK      154,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 9 NAME HALRON               B&F  STATUS   1.484800

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0117

                OFFER NUMBER 26 NAME WARNER PETROLEUM COR B&F  STATUS   2.887400

  291-75 ST. IGNACE      Marine Gas          TANK TRUCK           200,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 9 NAME HALRON               B&F  STATUS   1.320000

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0117

                OFFER NUMBER 26 NAME WARNER PETROLEUM COR B&F  STATUS   2.531700

 STATE OF MINNESOTA

  205-75 
DULUTH          Marine Gas      TANK TRUCK             130,400GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 10 NAME HARBOR CITY OIL      B&F  STATUS   1.254500

                              AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0103

                 OFFER NUMBER 9 NAME HALRON               B&F  STATUS   1.410000

STATE OF MISSOURI

  121-34 
CAPE  GIRARDEAU Diesel Fuel #2 TANK TRUCK         200,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 29 NAME KIDD OIL CO. INC.    B&F  STATUS   1.152300

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0110

  126-34
 ST. LOUIS       Diesel Fuel #2                PIPELINE           700,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 28 NAME THE KIESEL COMPANY   B&F  STATUS   1.132300

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0094
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STATE OF NEBRASKA

  379-75 OMAHA           Marine Gas TANK TRUCK      180,000GL  

                NO BID

 STATE OF NEW HAMPSHIRE

  840-75 NEWINGTON       Marine Gas TANK TRUCK       50,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 22 NAME SPRAGUE ENERGY       B&F  STATUS   1.179800

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0105

                OFFER NUMBER 2 NAME CONTINENTAL FUELS, I B&F  STATUS   1.281600

 STATE OF NEW JERSEY

  293-75 BAYONNE         Marine Gas   TANK TRUCK          220,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 30 NAME NAUGHTON ENERGY      B&F  STATUS   1.337200

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0097

                OFFER NUMBER 11 NAME HARBOR PETROLEM INC. B&F  STATUS   1.590000

                OFFER NUMBER 4 NAME CARIBOU MARINE SERVI B&F  STATUS   3.200000

                OFFER NUMBER 5 NAME D & G OIL EXPLORATIO B&F  STATUS   3.580000

  850-96 BAYONNE         Fuel Oil,        BARGE                    1,500,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 3 NAME CHEMOIL CORPORATION  B&F  STATUS   0.710000

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0107

                OFFER NUMBER 24 NAME TRANS-TEC SERVICES I B&F  STATUS   0.829200

                OFFER NUMBER 2 NAME CONTINENTAL FUELS, I B&F  STATUS   0.902100

                OFFER NUMBER 5 NAME D & G OIL EXPLORATIO B&F  STATUS   3.580000

OFFICIAL ABSTRACT FOR Final Price Revision OFFER STATUS

MASTER SOLICITATION   SP0600-01-R-0114
                                                                           METHOD          MULTI-YEAR               

  LINE      
 BUNKER,                                OF SUPPLY     ESTIMATED                     

  ITEM NO
 LOCATION        PRODUCT    DELIVERY
QUANTITY     

  294-75        CAPE MAY        Marine Gas          TANK TRUCK         300,000GL  

                      OFFER NUMBER 16 NAME LOUIS NARDELLO CO. I B&F  STATUS   1.162600

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0119

                     OFFER NUMBER 2 NAME CONTINENTAL FUELS, I B&F  STATUS   1.371400

                     OFFER NUMBER 4 NAME CARIBOU MARINE SERVI B&F  STATUS   1.420000

                      OFFER NUMBER 5 NAME D & G OIL EXPLORATIO B&F  STATUS   3.580000

 216-75        HIGHLANDS       Marine Gas       TANK TRUCK           140,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 5 NAME D & G OIL EXPLORATIO B&F  STATUS   3.580000

 STATE OF OHIO

  297-75          CLEVELAND       Marine Gas        TANK TRUCK      180,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 9 NAME HALRON               B&F  STATUS   1.329900

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0117

 STATE OF OREGON

  131-75         ASTORIA         Marine Gas Oil             BARGE            1,750,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 33 NAME RAINIER PETROLEUM CO B&F  STATUS   1.438300

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0115

                OFFER NUMBER 24 NAME TRANS-TEC SERVICES I B&F  STATUS   1.988300

                Withdrew

335-75 
      ASTORIA         Marine Gas          TANK TRUCK                    215,600GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 33 NAME RAINIER PETROLEUM CO B&F  STATUS   1.248300

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0115
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336-75                    ASTORIA         Marine Gas TANK TRUCK      461,620GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 33 NAME RAINIER PETROLEUM CO B&F  STATUS   1.428300

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0115

  340-75      COOS BAY        Marine Gas    TANK TRUCK              402,200GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 8 NAME GRAHAM OIL           B&F  STATUS   1.230700

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0106

  341-75      COOS BAY        Marine Gas Oil      BARGE                  100,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 8 NAME GRAHAM OIL           B&F  STATUS   0.000000

                Withdrew offer

                OFFER NUMBER 24 NAME TRANS-TEC SERVICES I B&F  STATUS   0.000000

                Withdrew Offer

142-75 
     NEWPORT         Marine Gas    TANK TRUCK                100,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 8 NAME GRAHAM OIL           B&F  STATUS   1.230100

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0106

                OFFER NUMBER 33 NAME RAINIER PETROLEUM CO B&F  STATUS   1.451200

 STATE OF OREGON

  140-75 
PORTLAND        Marine Gas Oil        BARGE   
     500,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 33 NAME RAINIER PETROLEUM CO B&F  STATUS   1.238300

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0115

                OFFER NUMBER 24 NAME TRANS-TEC SERVICES I B&F  STATUS   1.538300

  141-75 
PORTLAND        Marine Gas          TANK TRUCK        126,400GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 33 NAME RAINIER PETROLEUM CO B&F  STATUS   1.333300

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0115
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STATE OF PENNSYLVANIA
  145-75           McKEES ROCK     Marine Gas          TANK TRUCK              250,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 1 NAME R. L. BOLEA, INC.    B&F  STATUS   1.120000

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0089

                OFFER NUMBER 30 NAME NAUGHTON ENERGY      B&F  STATUS   1.148400

                OFFER NUMBER 5 NAME D & G OIL EXPLORATIO B&F  STATUS   3.780000

556-75         PHILADELPHIA         Marine Gas Oil       BARGE                       700,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 24 NAME TRANS-TEC SERVICES I B&F  STATUS   0.000000

                Withdrew Offer

                OFFER NUMBER 16 NAME LOUIS NARDELLO CO. I B&F  STATUS   1.051300

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0119

                OFFER NUMBER 11 NAME HARBOR PETROLEM INC. B&F  STATUS   1.160000

                OFFER NUMBER 2 NAME CONTINENTAL FUELS, I B&F  STATUS   1.514700

                OFFER NUMBER 5 NAME D & G OIL EXPLORATIO B&F  STATUS   3.780000

STATE OF RHODE ISLAND

  211-75
 NEWPORT         Marine Gas     TANK TRUCK    
  400,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 7 NAME DREW OIL CORP.       B&F  STATUS   1.173200

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0101

                OFFER NUMBER 2 NAME CONTINENTAL FUELS, I B&F  STATUS   1.213200

                OFFER NUMBER 20 NAME SANTORO OIL CO. INC  B&F  STATUS   1.470000
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535-75 
       NEWPORT  NEWS   Marine Gas Oil   BARGE             300,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 24 NAME TRANS-TEC SERVICES I B&F  STATUS   0.000000

                Withdrew Offer

                OFFER NUMBER 7 NAME DREW OIL CORP.       B&F  STATUS   1.593200

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0101

                OFFER NUMBER 2 NAME CONTINENTAL FUELS, I B&F  STATUS   1.988500

 STATE OF VIRGINIA

  415-75 
NEWPORT NEWS      Marine Gas    TANK TRUCK        150,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 17 NAME PAPCO                B&F  STATUS   1.104000

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0120

                OFFER NUMBER 11 NAME HARBOR PETROLEM INC. B&F  STATUS   1.110000

                OFFER NUMBER 30 NAME NAUGHTON ENERGY      B&F  STATUS   1.125700

                OFFER NUMBER 2 NAME CONTINENTAL FUELS, I B&F  STATUS   1.150200

                OFFER NUMBER 19 NAME PHOENIX PETROLEUM CO B&F  STATUS   1.162200

                OFFER NUMBER 5 NAME D & G OIL EXPLORATIO B&F  STATUS   3.520000

  855-75          NORFOLK         Marine Gas Oil           BARGE                      4,000,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 12 NAME HINMAN SPECIALTY FUE B&F  STATUS   0.000000

                OFFER NUMBER 17 NAME PAPCO                B&F  STATUS   1.069700

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0120

                OFFER NUMBER 11 NAME HARBOR PETROLEM INC. B&F  STATUS   1.075000

                OFFER NUMBER 19 NAME PHOENIX PETROLEUM CO B&F  STATUS   1.089200

                OFFER NUMBER 2 NAME CONTINENTAL FUELS, I B&F  STATUS   1.106200

                OFFER NUMBER 20 NAME SANTORO OIL CO. INC  B&F  STATUS   1.180000

                OFFER NUMBER 24 NAME TRANS-TEC SERVICES I B&F  STATUS   1.250200

                OFFER NUMBER 5 NAME D & G OIL EXPLORATIO B&F  STATUS   2.790000
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855-96                NORFOLK         Fuel Oil,       BARGE               1,800,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 24 NAME TRANS-TEC SERVICES I B&F  STATUS   0.764300

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0091

                OFFER NUMBER 2 NAME CONTINENTAL FUELS, I B&F  STATUS   0.835700

                OFFER NUMBER 19 NAME PHOENIX PETROLEUM CO B&F  STATUS   1.049200

                OFFER NUMBER 5 NAME D & G OIL EXPLORATIO B&F  STATUS   2.790000

 STATE OF WASHINGTON

  150-75         ABERDEEN        Marine Gas Oil      BARGE             200,000USG 

                OFFER NUMBER 24 NAME TRANS-TEC SERVICES I B&F  STATUS   0.000000

                Withdrew Offer

                OFFER NUMBER 33 NAME RAINIER PETROLEUM CO B&F  STATUS   1.407627

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0115

                EPA EXCEPTION

                OFFER NUMBER 5 NAME D & G OIL EXPLORATIO B&F  STATUS   2.790000

  290-75
 PORT ANGELES    Marine Gas TANK TRUCK       300,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 33 NAME RAINIER PETROLEUM CO B&F  STATUS   1.344827

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0115

                EPA EXCEPTION

                OFFER NUMBER 5 NAME D & G OIL EXPLORATIO B&F  STATUS   2.790000

  430-75 
SEATTLE         Marine Gas Oil          PIPELINE         200,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 24 NAME TRANS-TEC SERVICES I B&F  STATUS   0.000000

                Withdrew Offer

                OFFER NUMBER 33 NAME RAINIER PETROLEUM CO B&F  STATUS   1.348500

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0115

                EPA EXCEPTION

                OFFER NUMBER 5 NAME D & G OIL EXPLORATIO B&F  STATUS   2.580000
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  860-96
 TACOMA          Fuel Oil,          BARGE            1,200,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 27 NAME FUEL AND MARINE MKT  B&F  STATUS   0.793407

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0092

                OFFER NUMBER 24 NAME TRANS-TEC SERVICES I B&F  STATUS   0.843907

                OFFER NUMBER 5 NAME D & G OIL EXPLORATIO B&F  STATUS   2.580000

  860-98
 TACOMA          Fuel Oil,         BARGE           420,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 27 NAME FUEL AND MARINE MKT  B&F  STATUS   0.798175

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0092

                OFFER NUMBER 24 NAME TRANS-TEC SERVICES I B&F  STATUS   0.848675

                OFFER NUMBER 5 NAME D & G OIL EXPLORATIO B&F  STATUS   2.580000

STATE OF WISCONSIN

  350-75
 MARINETTE       Marine Gas  TANK TRUCK        420,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 9 NAME HALRON               B&F  STATUS   1.520000

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0117

  285-75 
STURGEON BAY    Marine Gas  TANK TRUCK      200,000GL  

                OFFER NUMBER 9 NAME HALRON               B&F  STATUS   1.530000

                             AWARDED UNDER CONTRACT SP0600-01-D0117

  Total Number of Line Items in Solicitation SP0600-01-R-0114: 104

