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AKASAKA, HONSHU JA  ARMY 005-44 TT 155,120 0.728300
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB 0.921500 SOLE BID
KURE JA ARMY 008-26 FOB 65,000 0.762900
MITSUBISHI OIL CO., LTD. M121 FB KURE = 1.151500 SOLE BID
KURE JA ARMY 008-44 FOB 280,700 0.728300
MITSUBISHI OIL CO., LTD. M121 FB = 0.791400 SOLE BID
CAMP ZAMA HONSHU JA  ARMY 011-44 TT 372,000 0.728300
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB 0.921500 SOLE BID
CAMP ZAMA HONSHU JA  ARMY 016-44 TT 3,019,000 0.728300
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB 0.906500 SOLE BID
CAMP ZAMA HONSHU JA  ARMY 021-44 TT 275,700 0.728300
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB 0.921500 SOLE BID
CAMP ZAMA HONSHU JA  ARMY 026-44 TT 342,600 0.728300
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB 0.921500 SOLE BID
SAGAMI DEPOT HONSHU JA  ARMY 031-44 TT 1,863,200 0.728300
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB 0.906500 SOLE BID
SAGAMI DEPOT HONSHU JA  ARMY 032-44 TT 190,000 0.728300

EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB 0.921500 SOLE BID
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Sagami Depot Honshu JA ARMY 033-44 TW 44,000 0.728300
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB .921500 SOLE BID
SAGAMIHARA HONSHU JA  ARMY 036-44 TT 1,598,000 0.728300
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB .921500 SOLE BID
YOKOHAMA HONSHU JA  ARMY 041-44 TT 271,400 0.728300
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB .921500 SOLE BID
YOKOHAMA HONSHU JA  ARMY 045-44 TT 59,440 0.728300
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB .921500 SOLE BID
CAMP HANSEN OKINAWA [AA JA  ARMY 100-26 TT 700,000 0.762900
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB .983000 NO BID W/D
MCAS FUTENMA OKINAWA [AA JA  ARMY 105-26 TT 3,840,000 0.762900
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB .983000 NO BID W/D
CAMP FOSTER OKINAWA [AA JA ARMY 110-26 TT 5,000,000 0.762900
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB .983000 NO BID W/D
CAMP KINSER OKINAWA [AA JA ARMY 115-26 TW 1,100,000 0.762900
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB .983000 NO BID W/D
CAMP COURTNEY  OKINAWA [AA JA  ARMY 120-26 TT 2,160,000 0.762900
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB .983000 NO BID W/D
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CAMP SCHWAB OKINAWA [AA JA  ARMY 125-26 TW 65,000 0.762900
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB .983000 NO BID W/D
KADENA AB OKINAWA [AA JA  ARMY 130-26 TT 6,600,000 0.762900
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB .983000 NO BID W/D
KADENA AB OKINAWA [AA JA  ARMY 131-26 TT 4,200,000 0.762900
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB .983000 NO BID W/D
CHIBANA COMPOUN OKINAWA JA  ARMY 135-26 W 35,000 0.762900
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB .983000 NO BID W/D
CHIMU-WAN OKINAWA JA  ARMY 140-26 W 500 0.762900
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB . 983000 NO BID W/D
TORII STATION  OKINAWA JA  ARMY 145-26 TT 220,000 0.762900
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB .983000 NO BID W/D
NAHA PORT OKINAWA JA  ARMY 150-26 W 12,000 0.762900
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB .983000 NO BID W/D
YOKOSUKA HONSHU JA  NAVY 500-44 BRG 19,694,000 0.728300
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB .794000 SOLE BID
SASEBO CITY NAGASKI PRE JA  NAVY 501-44 TT 4,700,600 0.728300
MITSUBISHI OIL CO., LTD. M121 FB .037800 NO BID W/D
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YOKOSUKA HONSHU JA  NAVY 505-59 W 220,000 0.728300
SHOWA SHELL SEKIYU K.K. S330 FB 1.078300 SOLE BID
YOKOHAMA COMPLE HONSHU JA  NAVY 510-44 TT 1,344,000 0.728300
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB 0.906500 SOLE BID
YOKOHAMA COMPLE HONSHU JA  NAVY 515-44 W 301,000 0.728300
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB 0.921500 SOLE BID
YOKOHAMA COMPLE HONSHU JA  NAVY 520-44 W 80,000 0.728300
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB 0.921500 SOLE BID
YOKOSUKA HONSHU JA  NAVY 525-59 W 250,000 0.728300
SHOWA SHELL SEKIYU K.K. S330 FB 1.078300 SOLE BID
TOKYO HONSHU JA  NAVY 530-71 W 422,000 0.728300
SHOWA SHELL SEKIYU K.K. S330 FB 1.078300 SOLE BID
ATSUGI HONSHU JA  NAVY 535-441 TT 85,100 0.728300
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB 0.921500 SOLE BID
ATSUGI HONSHU JA  NAVY 535-443 W 419,950 0.728300
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB 0.921500 SOLE BID
ATSUGI HONSHU JA  NAVY 535-444 W 434,750 0.728300

EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB 0.921500 SOLE BID
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ATSUGI HONSHU JA  NAVY 535-445 TT 6,571,200 0.728300
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB 0.906500 SOLE BID
ATSUGI HONSHU JA  NAVY 539-59 W 140,000 0.728300
NO BID
ZUSHI CITY HONSHU JA  NAVY 540-44 TT 1,600,000 0.728300
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB 0.921500 SOLE BID
MCAS IWAKUNI SHIKOKU JA  NAVY 544-26 TT 864,000 0.762900
MITSUBISHI OIL CO., LTD. M121 FB 1.151500 SOLE BID
MCAS IWAKUNI SHIKOKU JA  NAVY 544-44 TT 4,800,000 0.728300
MITSUBISHI OIL CO., LTD. M121 FB 0.791400 SOLE BID
MCAS IWAKUNI SHIKOKU JA  NAVY 544-441 TT 399,262 0.728300
MITSUBISHI OIL CO., LTD. M121 FB 0.791400 SOLE BID
MCAS IWAKUNI SHIKOKU JA  NAVY 545-45 W 24,000 0.728300
NO BID
MCAS IWAKUNI SHIKOKU JA  NAVY 546-45 W 2,000 0.728300
NO BID
SASEBO KYUSHU JA  NAVY 552-44 W 2,409,000 0.728300
MITSUBISHI OIL CO., LTD. M121 FB 1.037800 NO BID W/D
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SASEBO KYUSHU JA  NAVY 554-71 W 80,000 0.728300
NO BID
DFSP TSURUMI HONSHU JA  NAVY 600-44 BRG 23,840,465 0.728300
JAPAN ENERGY CORPORATION J097 FB 0.709300
COSMO OIL CO., LTD €840 FB 0.748900
IDEMITSU KOSAN CO., LTD. 1163 FB 0.762100
MITSUBISHI OIL CO., LTD. M121 FB 0.770000
DFSP TSURUMI HONSHU JA  NAVY 600-441 BRG 6,774,495 0.728300
NO BID
DFSP TSURUMI HONSHU JA  NAVY 600-442 BRG 1,580,465 0.728300 I/C
NO BID
WHITE BEACH OKINAWA JA  NAVY 620-26 W 24,000 0.762900
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB 0.983000 NO BID W/D
CAMP SHIELDS OKINAWA JA  NAVY 625-26 TT 20,000 0.762900
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB 0.983000 NO BID W/D
CAMP HANSEN OKINAWA JA  NAVY 630-26 TT 170,000 0.762900
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB 0.983000 NO BID W/D
MCAS FUTENMA OKINAWA JA  NAVY 635-26 TT 75,000 0.762900
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB 0.983000 NO BID W/D
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CAMP FOSTER OKINAWA JA  NAVY 640-26 TT 400,000 0.762900
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB .983000 NO BID W/D
CAMP KINSER OKINAWA JA  NAVY 645-26 TT 90,000 0.762900
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB .983000 NO BID W/D
CAMP COURTNEY  OKINAWA JA  NAVY 650-26 W 55,000 0.762900
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB .983000 NO BID W/D
CAMP SCHWAB OKINAWA JA  NAVY 655-26 W 65,000 0.762900
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB .983000 NO BID W/D
LE-SHIMA OKINAWA JA  NAVY 660-26 W 10,000 0.762900
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB . 983000 NO BID W/D
NORTHERN TRAINI OKINAWA JA  NAVY 665-26 W 7,000 0.762900
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB .983000 NO BID W/D
YOKOTA AIR BASE HONSHU JA  USAF 750-59 TT 100,000 0.728300
SHOWA SHELL SEKIYU K.K. S330 FB .098300 SOLE BID
YOKOTA AIR BASE HONSHU JA  USAF 753-44 W 20,000 0.728300
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB .947300 SOLE BID
YOKOTA AIR BASE HONSHU JA  USAF 754-44 W 140,000 0.728300
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB .937300 SOLE BID
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YOKOTA AIR BASE HONSHU JA  USAF 755-44 TT 1,500,000 0.728300
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB 0.922300 SOLE BID
YOKOTA AIR BASE HONSHU JA  USAF 757-44 TW 4,400 0.728300
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB 0.947300 SOLE BID
YOKOTA AIR BASE HONSHU JA  USAF 758-44 W 40,000 0.728300
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB 0.947300 SOLE BID
YOKOTA AIR BASE HONSHU JA  USAF 759-44 W 4,200 0.728300
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB 0.947300 SOLE BID
MISAWA AIR BASE HONSHU JA  USAF 760-26 W 2,280,000 0.762900
MITSUBISHI OIL CO., LTD. M121 FB 1.127700 SOLE BID
MISAWA AIR BASE HONSHU JA  USAF 760-261 TT 522,000 0.762900
MITSUBISHI OIL CO., LTD. M121 FB 1.127700 SOLE BID
MISAWA AIR BASE HONSHU JA  USAF 760-44 W 8,000,000 0.728300
COSMO OIL CO., LTD €840 FB 0.982800 SOLE BID
MISAWA AIR BASE HONSHU JA  USAF 760-441 W 2,000,000 0.728300
COSMO OIL CO., LTD C840 FB 0.982800 SOLE BID
MISAWA AIR BASE HONSHU JA  USAF 760-45 W 8,000,000 0.728300

COSMO OIL CO., LTD C840 FB 0.982800 SOLE BID
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MISAWA AIR BASE HONSHU JA  USAF 760-451 W 2,000,000 0.728300
COSMO OIL CO., LTD €840 FB 0.982800 SOLE BID
MISAWA AIR BASE HONSHU JA  USAF 760-59 TW 276,000 0.728300
NO BID
YOKOTA AIR BASE HONSHU JA  USAF 761-44 TT 14,020,000 0.728300
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB 0.922300 SOLE BID
YOKOTA AIR BASE HONSHU JA  USAF 762-44 TT 85,200 0.728300
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB 0.947300 SOLE BID
YOKOTA AIR BASE HONSHU JA  USAF 763-26 TT 261,000 0.762900
NO BID
YOKOTA AIR BASE HONSHU JA  USAF 763-44 W 240,000 0.728300
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB 0.937300 SOLE BID
OKUMA OKINAWA JA  USAF 775-26 W 135,000 0.762900
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB 0.983000 NO BID W/D
KADENA AB OKINAWA JA  USAF 780-26 TT 700,000 0.762900
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB 0.983000 NO BID W/D
BISAGAWA OKINAWA JA  USAF 785-26 W 50,000 0.762900
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB 0.983000 NO BID W/D
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FBIS YOMITAN OKINAWA JA  USAF 790-26 W 5,000 0.762900
EXXONMOBIL AVIATION E151 LB 0.983000

NO BID W/D



